Riviera Beach CRA
Payment Authorization Checklist

Vendor Name: _1AY  TAPLIA)

Control No.: Invoice No.: |30

Invoice Date: Payment Amount: § 14 L. 50

— V)
Project Supervisor/Responsible Official: __ [0l Drowh
=

Reviewed/Approved by

O Project “scope of work and deliverables” reviewed ?
([ Payment support documentation appropriate based on work
scope ?

Deliverables due with this invoice have been received ?

If final payment, have all deliverables been received ?

Amount of payment is in agreement with payment schedule or is
appropriate and is within the limits of the fotal agreement ‘%Q

amount, on a cumulative amount basis ?

O Expense reimbursement amounts meet Agency guidelines or
amounts approved by the agreement.

O The nature of work being performed is within the scope of the
CRA plan.

I Funds for payment have been budgeted and are available from :
the appropriate source(s) for payment. M!

The invoice and supporfing documentation have been reviewed and it is approved for payment.

Date:

Approving Authority

Consent Agenda, at its meeting on . (If applicable)

O Payment approved by the Board of Commissioners by Motion No. or the

pre

u’*’swﬁi

II“I“



Conrad Koller

m————
From: MICHAEL HAYGOOD <mhaygood@haygoodlaw.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 04, 2015 2:45 PM
To: Tony Brown; Klemie Christie
Cc: Conrad Koller
Subject: FW: CRA October Invoice
Attachments: 12-0152 Riviera Beach CRA Viking #1310 11-3-15 4,621.50.pdf

| approve the invoice.

J. Michael Haygood

J. Michael Haygood, P.A.

701 Northpoint Parkway Suite 209
West Palm Beach, Florida 33407

Tel: 561-684-8311

Fax: 561-686-8764

E-mail: mhaygood@haygoodlaw.com

Attention: The information contained in this E-mail is attorney privileged
and confidential information intended only for the use of the individual(s)
named above. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copy of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please contact the sender by reply E-mail and
destroy all copies of the original message. Thank you.

From: Jay Taplin <jtaplin@taplinlaw.net>
Date: Tuesday, November 3, 2015 at 2:37 PM

To: MICHAEL HAYGOOD <mhaygood@haygoodlaw.com>
Subject: CRA October Invoice

Mike, | hope all is well.

| am attaching my invoice for October as we discussed. Please note that in addition to the 10% Courtesy Discount, there was a
significant amount of time | did not put on the bill.

Thanks Mike. Jay.

Jay A. Taplin

Florida Bar Board Certified Real Estate Law
Taplin & Associates

Suite 1510

1555 Palm Beach Lakes Boulevard ,
West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 \ Fieq

(561) 684-8399 (ph) NOVa i & =
(561) 471-8055 (fax) - a4



