Riviera Beach CRA Payment Authorization Checklist

Vendor Name: J	/IICHAEL HAYG	00D		
Control No.:	NA	Invoice No.:	NC 10	08
Invoice Date:		R 1, 2017		
Payment Amount: Project Supervisor	\$9,407.50 _ Responsible Offic	ial: SCOTT EV	ANS	
				Reviewed/Approved by
Project "scope	of work and del	iverables" reviewe	ed?	8
□ Payment supp work scope?	oort documentati	ion appropriate ba	ased on	
□ Deliverables o	lue with this invo	oice have been rec	ceived?	8
☐ If final payme	nt, have all deliv	erables been rece	ived?	MA
schedule or is	appropriate and	ement with payme I is within the lim n a cumulative ar	its of	
*		ants meet Agency ed by the agreeme		NA
□/The nature of of the CRA pla		ormed is within th	ne scope	
/		budgeted and are source(s) for pays		
The invoice and is approving Authori	pay ment.	11-1		n reviewed and it
☐ Payment appr	oved by the Boar	d of Commissione	ers by:	
Motion No				
or the Consent A	genda at its mee	eting on		. (If applicable)

November 1, 2017

Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency C/O Scott Evans 2001 Broadway, Suite 300 Riviera Beach, FL 33404

Re:

October Invoice

Dear Mr. Evans:

Attached are the statements for legal services from October 1, 2017 through October 31, 2017, in the total amount of \$9, 407.50.

If you have any questions regarding this statement, please let me know.

J- 11

Sincerely yours

Enclosures



J. Michael Haygood, PA 701 Northpoint Parkway Suite 209 West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 561-684-8311

Statement

Invoice No: NC-108 Date: 11/1/17

Bill to:

Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency

Scott Evans 2001 Broadway

Suite 300

Riviera Beach, FL 33404

Hourly	Fees						
<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	Timekeeper	Time	Rate	Amount		
10/10/17	Correspondence	J. Michael Haygood	0.2 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$53.00		
	Preparation of emails with 1	Darlene re: status of E	xchange Agr	eement.			
10/11/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	0.5 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$132.50		
	Review proposed subordination agreement.						
10/12/17	Document Preparation	J. Míchael Haygood	3.2 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$848.00		
	Preparation of Development	Agreement for Blue L	.agoon:				
10/12/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	1.9 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$503.50		
	Review of Blue Lagoon Propo	osal and sources and	uses of funds	¥.			
10/13/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	1.8 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$477.00		
	Review of proposed Ken Stapi	leton Agreement.					
10/13/17	Document Review	J. Michael Haygood	1.4 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$371.00		

	Review agreement for Gentile, G	las, et.al.			
10/16/17	Document Preparation	J. Michael Haygood	2.1 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$556.50
	Preparation of Development Agr	reement for Blue Lag	goon,		
10/16/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50
	Review of revised Gentile, Glas a	greement with atta	chinents.		
10/16/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50
	Review of revised Stapleton agre	ement with attachn	nents.		
10/17/17	Telephone Conference	J. Michael Haygood	0.4 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$106.00
	Telephone conference with Scott	Evans re; RFP for M	arina.		
10/17/17	Meeting	J. Michael Haygood	0.8 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$212.00
	Meeting with Commissioner Hub	bard and Scott Eva	ns.		
10/17/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50
	Review revised Resolution for Cr	ab-Pot.			
10/17/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50
	Review revised resolution and N	lodification Agreen	ient for Flori	da Court Repo	rting:
10/17/17	Document Review	J. Michael Haygood	1.1 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$291.50
	Review proposed agreement for 1	Dana Notingham.			
Preparation of Development Agreement 10/16/17 Review Document J. Mich Haygo Review of revised Gentile, Glas agreement 10/16/17 Review Document J. Mich Haygo Review of revised Stapleton agreement w 10/17/17 Telephone Conference J. Mich Haygo Telephone conference with Scott Evans in 10/17/17 Meeting J. Mich Haygo Meeting with Commissioner Hubbard an 10/17/17 Review Document J. Mich Haygo Review revised Resolution for Crab Pot. 10/17/17 Review Document J. Mich Haygo Review revised resolution and Modificat 10/17/17 Document Review J. Mich Haygo Review proposed agreement for Dana No 10/17/17 Document Review J. Mich Haygo Review of Notice to owner: 10/17/17 Meeting J. Mich Haygo Review of Notice to owner: 10/19/17 Document Preparation J. Mich Haygo Preparation of Development Agreement: 10/19/17 Document Preparation J. Mich Haygo Preparation of Modification to PBCG an 10/20/17 Document Review J. Mich Haygo Review of correspondence from Property 10/20/17 Telephone Conference J. Mich	J. Michael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50	
	Review of Notice to owner.				
10/17/17	Meeting	J. Michael Haygood	1.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$344.50
	Meeting with CRA staff re: Event	Center.			
10/19/17	Document Preparation	J. Michael Haygood	3.8 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$1,007.00
	Preparation of Development Agr	reement.			
10/19/17	Haygood Review revised Resolution for Crab Pot. 7/17 Review Document J. Michael 0.3 hrs \$265.00/HR \$79	\$450.50			
	Preparation of Modification to	PBCG and resolution	r approving.		
10/20/17	Document Review	J. Michael Haygood	0.7 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$185.50
	Review of correspondence from F	Property Appraiser's	re:plat for Si	nger Gateway.	
10/20/17	Telephone Conference	J. Michael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50

	Telephone conference with S	cott Evans re: Singer	Island Gatew	ay.	
10/20/17	Document Review	J. Michael Haygood	2.1 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$556.50
	Review of Agreement with M	illerGroup3 and che	ck of corporate	e status:	,
10/24/17	Document Review	J. Míchael Haygood	0.8 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$212.00
	Review of proposed agreeme	nt for Shaun Davis a	ınd Associates.		
10/24/17	Review Document	J. Michael Haygood	1.2 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$318.00
	Review and commented on Vendors.	proposed application	r and agreeme	ent for Green Ma	ırket
10/24/17	Correspondence	J. Michael Haygood	0.4 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$106.00
	Review of correspondence from	om Counsel for the C	ity re: Cagel.		
10/25/17	Meeting	J. Míchael Haygood	4.1 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$1,086.50
	Attendance at CRA meeting	4			
10/25/17	Document Review	J. Michael Haygood	0.6 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$159.00
	Review of comments to draft	t of agreement for M	illerGroup3.		
10/25/17	Document Preparation	J. Michael Haygood	2.1 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$556.50
	Finalized draft of Blue Lage	oon Development Ag	reement.		
10/30/17	Telephone Conference	J. Míchael Haygood	0.3 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$79.50
	Telephone conference with l	Viliam Mueller re: E)	ichange Agree	ment.	
10/31/17	Draft Document	J. Michael Haygood	1.2 hrs	\$265.00/HR	\$318.00
	Draft of letter to Property Ap	praiser.			
7	Hourly Fees Total		35.5	\$	9,407.50
			hrs		