From: Jones, Danny

To: cap@capfla.com

Cc: Little, Rickey; Mealy, Dean; jmellies@capfla.com; Gagnon, Jeff; Frazier, Jackie P
Subject: FW: Riviera Beach Invoice for September Services

Date: Tuesday, October 11, 2016 10:56:51 AM

Attachments: Project 000127000.00 Invoice 0003922 (sept).pdf

Mr. Penin,

As discussed yesterday afternoon, | need detailed backup information in order to approve payment
for the invoices you submitted on behalf of C.A.P.

I need to know what jobs or plans were being reviewed or inspected for the number of hours
submitted.

I will also use this information to analyze the amount of time spent on the various levels of plans
submitted and the inspections completed.

The City cannot over pay for services not rendered nor should we not properly compensate CAP for
services provided.

Detailed invoices must be a part of the checks and balances in this business relationship.

I would like to have the requested information by close of business on Friday so that the proper
attention can be provided to compensate CAP accordingly.

Thanks,

Danny D. Jones
Interim City Manager

ddjones@rivierabch.com

From: Little, Rickey

Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2016 7:41 AM

To: Jones, Danny <ddjones@Rivierabch.com>; Gagnon, Jeff <Jgagnon@Rivierabch.com>
Subject: Fwd: Riviera Beach Invoice for September Services

Here is the invoice from CA P
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jennifer Mellies <imellies@capfla.com>
Date: October 10, 2016 at 3:18:03 PM EDT
To: "rlittle@rivierabch.com" <rlittle@rivierabch.com>
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Invoice

343 Almeria Avenue
Coral Gables, FL 33134
Office 305.448.1711 Fax 305.448.1712

Peter Ringle

. L October 10, 2016
City of Riviera Beach

. . Project No: 000127000.00
City of Riviera Beach Invoice No: 0003922
600 West Blue Heron Blvd.
Riviera Beach, FL 33404
Project 000127000.00 City of Riviera Beach Plan Review and Inspection Services

Professional Services from September 1, 2016 to September 30, 2016
Professional Personnel

Hours Rate Amount
Structural Plans Examiner 216.25 75.00 16,218.75
Electrical Plans Examiner 91.00 75.00 6,825.00
Mechanical Plans Examiner 140.50 75.00 10,537.50
Plumbing Plans Examiner 17.50 75.00 1,312.50
Fire Plans Examiner 4.75 75.00 356.25
Structural Inspector 11.00 65.00 715.00
Electrical Inspector 19.00 65.00 1,235.00
Mechanical Inspector 24.75 65.00 1,608.75
Plumbing Inspector 89.75 65.00 5,833.75
Totals 614.50 44,642.50
Total Labor 44,642.50
Additional Fees
Building Official Services 1,600.00
Total Additional Fees 1,600.00 1,600.00
Total this Invoice $46,242.50
Authorized Date: 10/10/16

By:

Mr. Carlos Penin, PE






Project

000127000.00

Riviera Beach PR & Insp

Invoice

Billing Backup

C.A.P. Government, Inc.

Invoice 0003922 Dated 10/10/2016

Monday, October 10, 2016
3:20:23 PM

Project

000127000.00

Professional Personnel

Structural Plans Examiner
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Electrical Plans Examiner
Organ, Douglas
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Pearson, John

City of Riviera Beach Plan Review and Inspection Services

8/31/2016
9/1/2016
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393.75
600.00
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375.00
450.00
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Project 000127000.00 Riviera Beach PR & Insp Invoice
01627 Pearson, John 9/13/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/14/2016 4,50 75.00 337.50
01627 Pearson, John 9/15/2016 6.00 75.00 450.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/19/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/20/2016 5.00 75.00 375.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/21/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/22/2016 7.00 75.00 525.00
01572 Sugg, Jimmy 8/31/2016 6.00 75.00 450.00
01572 Sugg, Jimmy 9/1/2016 6.00 75.00 450.00
01572 Sugg, Jimmy 9/9/2016 6.00 75.00 450.00
01572 Sugg, Jimmy 9/28/2016 2.50 75.00 187.50
01572 Sugg, Jimmy 9/29/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01572 Sugg, Jimmy 9/30/2016 4.00 75.00 300.00
Mechanical Plans Examiner
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/12/2016 6.00 75.00 450.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/13/2016 7.00 75.00 525.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/14/2016 2.50 75.00 187.50
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/15/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/16/2016 7.00 75.00 525.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/19/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/20/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/21/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/22/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/23/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/26/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/27/2016 4.00 75.00 300.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/28/2016 4.00 75.00 300.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/29/2016 4.00 75.00 300.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/30/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/21/2016 4.00 75.00 300.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/22/2016 10.00 75.00 750.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/23/2016 10.00 75.00 750.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/26/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/27/2016 6.00 75.00 450.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/28/2016 2.00 75.00 150.00
01543 McNicholas, Martha 9/30/2016 2.00 75.00 150.00
Plumbing Plans Examiner
01555 Mather, James 9/6/2016 2.00 75.00 150.00
01555 Mather, James 9/9/2016 8.00 75.00 600.00
01555 Mather, James 9/12/2016 .50 75.00 37.50
01555 Mather, James 9/13/2016 4,50 75.00 337.50
01555 Mather, James 9/19/2016 2.50 75.00 187.50
Fire Plans Examiner
01628 Lee, Selwyn 9/26/2016 2.00 75.00 150.00
01628 Lee, Selwyn 9/30/2016 2.75 75.00 206.25
Structural Inspector
01567 Dulany, Judson 9/20/2016 3.00 65.00 195.00
01567 Dulany, Judson 9/23/2016 8.00 65.00 520.00
Electrical Inspector
01623 Nutter, Deborah 9/2/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
01623 Nutter, Deborah 9/6/2016 1.50 65.00 97.50
01623 Nutter, Deborah 9/23/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
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Project 000127000.00 Riviera Beach PR & Insp Invoice 0003922
01608 Organ, Douglas 9/26/2016 4.50 65.00 292.50
01627 Pearson, John 9/12/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/22/2016 1.00 65.00 65.00
01627 Pearson, John 9/27/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
Mechanical Inspector
01614 Deloach, Warren 8/31/2016 .75 65.00 48.75
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/12/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/13/2016 1.00 65.00 65.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/14/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/16/2016 1.00 65.00 65.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/27/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/28/2016 3.00 65.00 195.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/29/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
01592 Kajak, Joseph 9/21/2016 3.00 65.00 195.00
01592 Kajak, Joseph 9/23/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
01592 Kajak, Joseph 9/30/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
Plumbing Inspector
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/27/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/28/2016 1.00 65.00 65.00
01614 Deloach, Warren 9/29/2016 2.00 65.00 130.00
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/15/2016 2.50 65.00 162.50
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/16/2016 3.50 65.00 227.50
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/21/2016 4.50 65.00 292.50
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/22/2016 3.50 65.00 227.50
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/23/2016 6.00 65.00 390.00
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/29/2016 6.50 65.00 422.50
01616 Guendjoian, Armen 9/30/2016 5.50 65.00 357.50
01592 Kajak, Joseph 9/14/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
01555 Mather, James 8/31/2016 8.00 65.00 520.00
01555 Mather, James 9/1/2016 8.00 65.00 520.00
01555 Mather, James 9/2/2016 7.00 65.00 455.00
01555 Mather, James 9/7/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
01555 Mather, James 9/8/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
01555 Mather, James 9/12/2016 6.75 65.00 438.75
01555 Mather, James 9/13/2016 2.50 65.00 162.50
01555 Mather, James 9/19/2016 450 65.00 292.50
01555 Mather, James 9/20/2016 4.00 65.00 260.00
Totals 614.50 44,642.50
Total Labor 44,642.50
Total this Project $44,642.50
Total this Report $44,642.50
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Cc: "Carlos A. Penin" <cap@capfla.com>, Joseph Kajak <jkajak@capfla.net>
Subject: Riviera Beach Invoice for September Services

Mr. Little,

Attached you will find a certified copy of our September Plan Review & Inspection Services
invoice from CAP Government. If you should have any questions please feel free to
contact me at the number listed below or via email.

Thank You,

Jennifer
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