Riviera Beach CRA
Payment Authorization Checklist

Vendor Name: M 4 Wif( /)ZK(//['\M
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Project Supervisor/Responsible Official: NA’
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E.l/ Payment support documentation approbriate based on work ﬁ
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El/ Deliverables due with this invoice have been received ? ?
If final payment, have all delivérables been received ? M

Amount of payment is in agreement with payment schedule or is
appropriate and is within the limits of the total agreement
amount, on a cumulative amount basis ?
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Expense reimbursement amounts meet Agency guidelines or
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CRA plan.
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the appropriate source(s) for payment.
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The invoice and supporting documentation have been reviewed and it is approved for papent,

qg\ Date: /) 7/Af

App@.b@mw

Consent Agenda, at its meeting on . (If applicably
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J. MICHAEL HAYGOOD, PA. ’ ATTORNEY AT LAW

701 NORTHPOINT PARKWAY, SUITE 209
WEST PALM BEACH, FL 33407

December 6, 2016

Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency
C/0 Scott Evans

2001 Broadway, Suite 300

Riviera Beach, FL 33404

Re: November Invoice

Attached are the statements for legal services from November 1, 2016
through November 30, 2016, in the total amount of $10,070.00.

If you have any questions regardingthi§ statgment, pleasejet me know.

Enclosures

OFFICE: 561.684.8311 | FAX: 561.686.8764 | MHAYGOOD@HAYGOODLAW.COM



Riviera Beach Community
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Redevelopment Agency - NC-87 12/6{16, 3:40 PM

1 ———

J. Michael Haygood, PA
701 Northpoint Parkway S WM

Suite 209

st;]%t-g;ﬁas;ﬁh’ Flarida 33401 vt e NG-87
Date: 12/6/16

Billto: Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency

LUU L proaaway
Swite 300
RivieraoBeach, FL 33404 .

Houwrly Fees
Dale Description Timekeeper Time Rate Amount
11/16/16 Document Review J. Michael 1.8 hey $265.00/HR $477.00
Haygood
Review of Amended and Restated LOI and preporation of questions thervefore.
11/29/16 Document Preparalion J. Michael 3.7 hwy $265.00/HR $980.50
Hoygood

11/29/16 TMWCW&W J. Michael 0.5 hry $265.00/HR $132.50
Haygood
Telephone conference with-Annetta: Jenking re: Purchase and Sale Agreement.
11/30/16 Docwment Review J. Michael 1.3 ey $265.00/HR $344.50
Hoygood
Review of proposed contract fov sale and purchase.
Hourly Fees Total 7.3 hry $1,934.50

Preparation of Purchase and Sale Agreement; telephone conference withyAnnetto
Jenking

Balance: $1,934.50

file:j//Users/michaelhaygood/Library/Preferences/TimeNet%20Law%20Data/tnl-bill8920208.htmi Page 1 0f 1



Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency - NC-85 12/6/16, 3:31 PM
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J. Michael Haygood, PA

701 Northpoint Parkway Stmwm
Suite 209

West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 "
561-684-8311 Irnwoice No: NC-85

Date: 12/6/16

Bill'to: Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency

20U1 Broadway
Suwite 300
RivieravBeach; FL 33404

Hourly Fees _
11/15/16 Telephone Conference J. Michael 0.6 hay $265.00/HR  $159.00
Haygood, :
Telephowe conference with-Scott Eveuns:
11/15/16 Review File J. Michael 1.1 hey $265.00/HR  $291.50
Haygood,
Review of Exchange Agreement file:
11/16/16 Meeting J. Michael 2.7 hy $265.00/HR  $715.50
Haygood
Meeting with-CRA staff and Viking representutive:
Houwrly Fees Total 4.4 hry $1,166.00
Balance: $1,166.00

b

file:f//Users/michaelhaygood/Library/Preferences/TimeNet%20Law%20Dataftnl-bilI3303605.htmi Page 1 0of 1



Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency - NC-86
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). Michael Haygood, PA

701 Northpoint Parkway

Suite 209

West Palm Beach, Florida 33401
561-684-8311

12/6/1

6, 3:38 PM

Statement

Irwerice No: NC-86
Dater 12/6/16

Bllto: Riviera Beach Comumunity Redevelopment Agency

S S
zvui Broaawwy
Swite 300

RivieravBeach, FL 33404

Howrly Fees
Dale Deyoriptiow
11/2/16 Docwment Preparalion

11/2/16 Telephone Conference
11/2/16 Document Preparatiov
11/8/16 Review Document

11/8/16 Review Document

Review of title search.
11/9/16 Meeting

Timekeeper Time

Prepavatiov of revised resolution and: new lease with- MTN

Telephone conference with Scott Evens:

Preparatiov of memorandiwn to-Board:

Review of memorandun frowy Finance:

J. Michael 2.3 hry
Haygood
J. Michael: 0.5 hry
Hoygood
J. Michael 2.3 hry
Haygood
J. Michael 0.4 hry
Hoygood
J. Michael 0.5 hry
Haygood
J. Michael 2.2 hey
Haygood

file://{/Users/michaelhaygood/Library/Preferences/TimeNet%20Law%20Data/tnl-bill4475789.html|

Rate
$265.00/HR

$265.00/HR

$265.00/HR

$265.00/HR

$265.00/HR

$265.00/HR

Amount
$609.50

$132.50

$609.50

$106.00

$132.50

$583.00

Page 10f 3



Riviera Beach Community Redevelopment Agency - NC-86

12/6/16, 3:38 PM

Attendance, at CRA meeling: _
11/9/16 Telephone Conference J. Michael 0.4 hry $265.00/HR  $106.00
Haygoods
Telephone conference with Weity re: lievu
11/10/16 Meeling J. Michael 2.3 huy $265.00/HR $609.50
Haygpodz
Meeting with-CRA staff:
11/14/16 Document Preparaliow J. Michael 2.1 hry $265.00/HR $556.50
Haygood
Preparatiow of memorandun to-Scotl Evans.
11/14/16 Document Review J. Michael 0.5 hry $265.00/HR $132.50
Hoygood
Review of email and response re: Cagle v. Riviera Beoch:
11/14/16 Review Document J. Michael 0.5 hey $265.00/HR $132.50
Haygood
Review and conmenty to- memorandwaw from Scott Evang re: Sublease:
11/15/16 Review Docuwment J. Michael 0.7 hry $265.00/HR  $185.50
Haygood
Review of final drafty of kisok license agreementsy:
11/16/16 Review Document J. Michael 0.5 hry $265.00/HR $132.50
Haygood
Review of Kisok documenty:
11/16/16 Meeling J. Michael 3.8y $265.00/HR $1,007.00
Haygood
Meeting with CRA staff and CDE Bowrd members:
11/17/16 Meeting J. Michael 0.5 hry $265.00/HR $132.50
Haygood
Meeting with Jow O'Connell re: Pascarelli,
11/17/16 Telepthom‘brW J. Michael 0.3y $265.00/HR $79.50
Haygood
Telephone conference with Tenont at Rafiki Tikis
11/28/16 Meeting J. Michael 2.2 g $265.00/HR $583.00
Hoygood
Meeting with CRA .Staff
11/29/16 Meeting J. Michael 2.5 hwy $265.00/HR $662.50
Haygood
Meeting with Scott Evans and, Jow O'Connell ve: Elicv Pascerilla
11/30/16 Document Preparatiow J. Michael 1.8 hwy $265.00/HR $477.00
Haygood
Prepavation of revised agreement for MTN Investmenty:
Hourly Fees Tolal 26.3 $6,969.50
hry
ﬁle:mUserslmichaeIhaygood[Library}Prelerences{TimeNet%20Law%2ODala/lnl-bi!l4475789.htmI Page 2 of 3



Riviera Beach Cammunity Redavelopment Agency - NC-88 ‘ 12/616, 3:38 PM

| |
% Balance: $6,969.50

file:/{fUsers/michaethaygood/Library/Preferances/ TimeNet% 20Law% 200 ata/tnl-bill44 75789, htmi Page 30f 3



